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RE: Request for Information held by SWFRS
Your request ref: 189 1920 has been dealt with under the Freedom of Information Act 2000.

You asked us:

Materials involved in the fire

1) Any record of the nature and volume of materials that burnt during the incident.

We do not record the details of all materials involved in the fire, only the item first ignited and the
item mainly responsible for the fire spread, both of which are provided in as much detail as we hold.

2) Any record of the time that different materials began to burn if materials could be distinguished.
We do not record this information.

Nature of the burn

3) Detail from any pyre temperature measurements taken: time, temperature and materials burnt
(as available)

We do not record this information.

4) Detail of fire service air quality monitoring undertaken: time, location, parameters monitored
and specifics of equipment used.
We do not record this information.

Fire techniques involved

5) Extent of appliance response including numbers, nature and duration on site

The attached spreadsheet reports the numbers of appliance attendances at the incident. They would
not necessarily have been in attendance at the same time and a single appliance may have attended
the incident a number of times during the course of the incident.

The incident duration gives the time from the first appliance arriving on scene to the last appliance
leaving the scene.
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6) Record of fire intervention techniques used: time, burning materials involved, etc. For example
where materials were removed from a pile (e.g. tyres) and deluged
We do not record this information.

If you have any queries regarding your Freedom of Information request, please contact us at
Dataprotection@southwales-fire.gov.uk quoting the reference number above in any future
communication.

If you are dissatisfied with the way that your information request has been handled, you can request
an internal review by writing to:

Information Governance and Compliance Manager
South Wales Fire and Rescue Service

Forest View Business Park

Llantrisant

CF72 8LX

If you remain dissatisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to appeal to the
Information Commissioner at:

Information Commissioner’s Office-\Wales,
2nd Floor,

Churchill House,

Churchill Way,

Cardiff,
CF10 2HH.

There is no charge for making an appeal.

Yours Faithfully

Information Governance and Compliance

Dataprotection@southwales-fire.gov.uk
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